
Product Description Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

Avigilon ACC7-ENT 

Software License 
300 $212.70 $63,810.00 $215.97 $64,791.00 $221.18 $66,354.00 $245.00 $73,500.00 $292.00 $87,600.00 $294.67 $88,401.00

1 Year -Avigilon Smart 

Assurance Plan 
300 $21.57 $6,471.00 $21.90 $6,570.00 $22.43 $6,729.00 $25.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid $29.67 $8,901.00

3 Year -Avigilon Smart 

Assurance Plan 
300 $46.74 $14,022.00 $47.46 $14,238.00 $48.60 $14,580.00 $55.00 $16,500.00 No Bid No Bid $64.67 $19,401.00

5 Year -Avigilon Smart 

Assurance Plan 
300 $60.70 $18,210.00 $73.01 $21,903.00 $74.77 $22,431.00 $85.00 $25,500.00 No Bid No Bid $99.33 $29,799.00

Grand Total With 5 Year Plan

B22-14, Avigilon 

Licensing Tabsheet 

Optional Items

Caruth

$118,200.00

AISG Net Planner

$82,020.00 $86,694.00

MCA EMC Security Adorama

$88,785.00 $99,000.00 N/A


